LEGISLATIVE ASSEMBLY OF THE STATE OF GOA

THE GOA SALARY, ALLOWANCES AND
PENSION OF MEMBERS OF THE LEGISLATIVE
ASSEMBLY (THIRD AMENDMENT)

BILL, 2009

* (Bill No. 16 of 2009)

(As passed by the Legislative Assembly of the State of Goa)

GOA LEGISLATURE SECRETARIAT,
ASSEMBLY HALL, PORVORIM, GOA
AUGUST, 2009



The Goa Salary, Allowances and Pension
of Members of the Legislative Assembly
(Third Amendment) Bill, 2009

(Bill No. 16 of 2009)

A
BILL

further to amend the Goa Salary, Allowances
and Pension of Members of the Legislative
Assembly Act, 2004 (Act 20 of 2004).

BE it enacted by the Legislative Assembly of
the State of Goa in the Sixtieth Year of the Republic
of India as follows:—

1. Short title and commencement.— (1) This
Act may be called the Goa Salary, Allowances
and Pension of Members of the Legislative
Assembly (Third Amendment) Act, 2009.

(2) It shall be deemed to have come into force
on the 1% day of April, 2009.

2. Amendment of section 3.— In section 3 of
the Goa Salary, Allowances and Pension of
Members of the Legislative Assembly Act, 2004
(Goa Act 20 of 2004) (hereinafter referred to as
the “principal Act”),-

(i) in sub-section (1), for the expression
“seven hundred and fifty rupees”, the
expression ‘“one thousand rupees” shall be
substituted;



—_—2 —

(ii) in sub-section (2), for the expression

“Rs. 300/- (Rupees three hundred only)”, the

expression “Rs.750/- (Rupees seven hundred

and fifty only)” shall be substituted.

3. Amendment of section 6.— In section 6 of
the principal Act, in sub-section (1), for the letters,
figures and word “Rs. 12 lakhs”, the letters,
figures and word “Rs. 30 lakhs” shall be
substituted.

(2) In Section 6 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (1), for the expression “period of
ten years” the expression “period of twenty
years” shall be substituted.

(3) In Section 6 of the principal Act, in
sub-section (1), the following proviso shall be
inserted namely “Provided that the balance of
_the increase in the loan amount can be availed
of, by any member who has availed of the loan
on an earlier occasion”

4. Amendment of section 9.- In section 9 of the
principal Act, for the words “twenty six thousand
rupees”, the words “fifty five thousand rupees"
shall be substituted.

5. Amendment of section 11.— In section 11 of
the principal Act, in sub-section (1),-

(i) for the words “rupees five thousand”,
the words “rupees eight tbousand" shall be
substituted;

(ii)) for the words “one thousand rupees”,

the words “one thousand and two hundred

— 3 —
fifty rupees” shall be substituted;
(iii) for the words “rupees twenty seven

thousand”, the words “rupees fifty thousand”
shall be substituted.

6. Amendment of section 19.— In section 19 of
the principal Act, for the expression “Rs. 18,000/-

‘(Rupees eighteen thousand only)”, the

expression “Rs. 32,000/- (Rupees thirty two
thousand only)” shall be substituted.



